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endourology has recently revolutionized the performance of 
RIRS and significantly improved its outcomes. Supported 
by clinical and experimental evidence, the UAS has under-
gone a substantial transformation in recent years [2] but 
randomized trials are far and few. The results of this study 
are compelling: the FANS group demonstrated a signifi-
cantly higher stone-free rate at one month (95% vs. 67%), 
reduced operative time, lower postoperative complication 
rates (notably less haematuria and pain), and a reduced 
need for re-intervention compared to the conventional UAS 
group. Importantly, these benefits were achieved without an 
increase in intraoperative complications or length of hos-
pital stay. These findings suggest that the use of FANS not 
only improves the technical efficiency of stone clearance, 
translates into tangible benefits for patient recovery and 
resource utilization but also validates the feeling that suc-
tion could definitively reshape “the future of endourology” 
[3, 4]. The FANS device’s integration of a flexible, navi-
gable tip with continuous suction represents a meaningful 
step forward in sheath technology. By facilitating the active 
removal of stone fragments and irrigation fluid, FANS 
appears to address two key challenges in RIRS: maintain-
ing a clear operative field and reducing intrarenal pressure, 
both of which are linked to improved stone clearance and 
especially reduced infectious complications. The ability 
of FANS to reach the renal calyces, as highlighted by the 
authors, may be particularly advantageous for patients with 
larger or more complex stones, although this subgroup was 
not the primary focus of the current study.

While the findings are promising, several limitations 
warrant consideration. The sample size, while adequately 
powered for the primary endpoint, remains modest, and 
the follow-up period is limited to one month. Longer-term 
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We read with great interest the study by Cacciatore et 

al. who present a timely and well-executed multicenter ran-
domized comparison of the flexible and navigable suction 
ureteral access sheath (FANS) versus conventional ure-
teral access sheaths (UAS) in retrograde intrarenal surgery 
(RIRS) for renal stones [1]. The authors should be com-
mended for their study, particularly for the inclusion and 
exclusion criteria that encompass the current guidelines for 
RIRS. Indeed, the use of high-power lasers, CT scan evalu-
ation of stone-free status, and reoperation rate for residual 
fragments further adds rigor to the methodology. With the 
growing prevalence of nephrolithiasis and the continual 
evolution of endourological technology, this investigation 
addresses a clinically relevant question: can technologi-
cal advancements in sheath design meaningfully improve 
patient outcomes in RIRS? The introduction of suction in 
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outcomes, including late complications and stone recur-
rence, remain to be elucidated. Additionally, the study 
excluded patients with very large or hard stones, so the appli-
cability of FANS in these challenging scenarios is yet to be 
determined. Cost-effectiveness, learning curve, and device 
durability are also important factors for widespread adop-
tion that were not addressed in this study. Future research 
should explore these aspects, as well as the potential ben-
efits of FANS in more complex stone burdens and patients 
at higher risk for infectious or bleeding complications. 
Another issue to be elucidated in future studies is the best 
lithotripsy modality using FANS because currently there is 
no evidence of the superiority of dusting versus stone frag-
mentation and extraction [5]. Lastly, it would be compelling 
to start using FANS with real-time intrarenal pressure moni-
toring to objectively demonstrate the superiority of FANS in 
decreasing infective complications as a sequelae of reduced 
intrarenal pressure. For now, FANS emerges as a promising 
tool that may set a new standard in the armamentarium for 
minimally invasive kidney stone surgery.
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